

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & DATE: (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY				
<b>GROUP 1</b>	<b>STANDARD REPAIR CLAMPS, MULTIPLE BAND</b>				
1.	20 ea. (SAWS #10397) Clamp, full circle repair, size 4" x 12", Range A 4.74-5.57, material stainless steel Make and Model	PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>85.85</b> <b>1,717.00</b> <b>3122 4x12</b>	83.60 1,672.00 Smith Blair 22700048012000	83.19 1,663.80 Smith Blair 227
2.	150 ea. (SAWS #10403) Clamp, full circle repair, size 6" x 15", Range A 6.62- 7.42, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>120.85</b> <b>18,127.50</b> <b>3122 6x16</b>	99.00 14,850.00 Smith Blair 22700066315000	98.52 14,778.00 Smith Blair 227
3.	20 ea. (SAWS #10379) Clamp, full circle repair, size 6" x 15", Range B 7.20- 8.00, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>121.55</b> <b>2,431.00</b> <b>3122 6x16</b>	111.30 2,226.00 Smith Blair X227 7.20-8.00x15	111.32 2,226.40 Smith Blair 227
4.	20 ea. (SAWS #10401) Clamp, full circle repair, size 8" x 15", Range A 8.50- 9.37, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>128.85</b> <b>2,577.00</b> <b>3,122.50</b>	111.30 2,226.00 X227 8.50-9.37x15	111.32 2,226.40 Smith Blair 227
5.	20 ea. (SAWS #10402) Clamp, full circle repair, size 8" x 15", Range B 9.25- 10.05, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>128.85</b> <b>2,577.00</b> <b>3122 8x16</b>	125.40 2,508.00 Smith Blair X227 9.25-10.05x15	125.23 2,504.60 Smith Blair 227
6.	20 ea. (SAWS #10380) Clamp, full circle repair, size 10" x 15", Range A 11.04 - 12.24, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>143.90</b> <b>2,878.00</b> <b>3122 10x16</b>	129.50 2,590.00 Smith Blair 22700111015000	129.21 2,584.20 Smith Blair 227
7.	25 ea. (SAWS #10383) Clamp, full circle repair, size 12" x 15", Range A13.14-14.34, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>156.05</b> <b>3,901.25</b> <b>3122 12x16</b>	143.10 3,577.50 Smith Blair 22700132015050	143.12 3,578.00 Smith Blair 227
8.	20 ea. (SAWS #10382) Clamp, full circle repair, size 12" x 15", Range B 13.64 - 14.85, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>156.05</b> <b>3,121.00</b> <b>3122 12x16</b>	143.59 2,871.80 Smith Blair 22700136515050	143.58 2,871.60 Smith Blair 227
9.	20 ea. (SAWS #10384) Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 10", Range A 18.08 - 18.84, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>104.40</b> <b>2,088.00</b> <b>3122 16x10</b>	149.67 2,993.40 X228 18.08-18.84x10	134.01 2,680.20 Smith Blair 228
10.	20 ea. (SAWS #10385) Size 16" x 20", Range B 17.15 - 17.90, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>239.95</b> <b>4,799.00</b> <b>3122 16x20</b>	271.84 5,436.80 Smith Blair 22820171520000	271.84 5,436.80 Smith Blair 228
11.	20 ea. (SAWS #10386) Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 20", Range C 18.46 - 19.21, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>239.95</b> <b>4,799.00</b> <b>3122 16x20</b>	283.15 5,663.00 Smith Blair 22820184620000	283.14 5,662.80 Smith Blair 228
12.	10 ea. (SAWS #10389) Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 10", Range A 22.90 - 23.65, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>115.60</b> <b>1,156.00</b> <b>3122 20x10</b>	194.38 1,943.80 Smith Blair 2280229010000	183.28 1,832.80 Smith Blair 228
13.	10 ea. (SAWS #10390) Full circle repair, size 20" x 20", Range B 21.52 - 22.27, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>277.10</b> <b>2,771.00</b> <b>3122 20x20</b>	328.63 3,286.30 Smith Blair 22820215220000	322.07 3,220.70 Smith Blair 228

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

14.	5 ea. (SAWS #10387) Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 20", Range C 23.21 - 23.97, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	277.10 1,385.50 3122 20x20	335.68 1,678.40 Smith Blair 22820232120000	310.88 1,554.40 Smith Blair 228	310.54 1,552.70 F2-2397-20
15.	5 ea. (SAWS #10392) Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 10", Range A 27.28 - 28.34, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	215.70 1,078.50 3123 24x10	344.64 1,723.20 Smith Blair X228 27.28-28.34x10	342.88 1,714.40 Smith Blair 228	302.88 1,514.40 F3-2834x10
16.	5 ea. (SAWS #10394) Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 20", Range B 25.70 - 26.80, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	393.10 1,965.50 3123 24x20	393.85 1,969.25 Smith Blair 22830257020000	391.85 1,959.25 Smith Blair 228	555.61 2,778.05 F3-2680x20
17.	5 ea. (SAWS #10391) Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 20", Range C 27.65-28.75, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	393.10 1,965.50 2123 24x20	404.76 2,023.80 Smith Blair 22830276520000	402.70 2,013.50 Smith Blair 228	590.72 2,953.60 F3-2875x20
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 1</b>	TOTAL	59,337.75	59,239.25	58,507.85	71,666.35
<b>GROUP 2</b>	<b>STANDARD TAPPED CLAMP COUPLINGS</b>					
1.	10 ea. (SAWS #10462) Clamp, tapped, size 6" x 2" IP, Range A 6.62 - 7.42, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	144.75 1,447.50 3132 6x16x2	165.23 1,652.30 Smith Blair 23900066315014	162.45 1,624.50 Smith Blair 239	
2.	10 ea. (SAWS #10461) Clamp, tapped, size 6" x 2" IP, Range B 7.20 - 8.00, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	144.75 1,447.50 3132 6x16x2	165.23 1,652.30 Smith Blair 23900072015014	162.45 1,624.50 Smith Blair 239	
3.	10 ea. (SAWS #10463) Clamp, tapped, size 8" x 2" IP, Range A 8.50 - 9.37, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	154.00 1,540.00 3132 8x16x2	161.96 1,619.60 Smith Blair X239 8.50 21P 15"	161.96 1,619.60 Smith Blair 239	
4.	10 ea. (SAWS #10464) Clamp, tapped, size 8" x 2" IP, Range B 9.25 - 10.05, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	154.00 1,540.00 3132 8x16x2	161.96 1,619.60 Smith Blair 23900092515014	161.96 1,619.60 Smith Blair 239	
5.	10 ea. (SAWS #10457) Clamp, tapped, size 10" x 2" IP, Range A11.04- 12.24, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	157.00 1,570.00 3132 10x16x2	243.08 2,430.80 Smith Blair X239 11.04-12.24 15x21P	241.84 2,418.40 Smith Blair 239	
6.	10 ea. (SAWS #10458) Clamp, tapped, size 12" x 2" IP, Range A13.14- 14.34, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	189.45 1,894.50 3132 12x16x2	266.18 2,661.80 Smith Blair X239 1314-1434 15x21P	266.17 2,661.70 Smith Blair 239	
7.	10 ea. (SAWS #10459) Clamp, Tapped, size 12" x 2" IP, Range B 13.65- 14.85, material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	189.45 1,894.50 3132 12x16x2	266.18 2,661.80 Smith Blair X239 13.65-14.85 x 21P 15	266.17 2,661.70 Smith Blair 239	
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 2</b>	TOTAL	11,334.00	14,298.20	14,230.00	

BID NOT TABULATED  
 DOES NOT MEE  
 SPECIFICATIONS

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & DATE: (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

GROUP 3	STANDARD DUCTILE IRON COUPLING	UNIT				
1.	100 ea. (SAWS #10992) Coupling, cast, size 2", Range 2.34" - 2.6" Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	16.55 1,655.00 3501 2"	13.45 1,345.00 Smith Blair 44100000263900	<b>13.33</b> <b>1,333.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	16.64 1,664.00 FC1-263x263
2.	10 ea. (SAWS #11000) Coupling, cast, size 4", Range 4.80-5.10 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	40.10 401.00 3501 4"	29.00 290.00 Smith Blair 44100000510900	<b>28.81</b> <b>288.10</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	29.63 296.30 FC1-510x510
3.	10 ea. (SAWS #11002) Coupling, cast, size 6", Range A 6.90-7.22 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	52.00 520.00 3501 6"	41.00 410.00 Smith Blair 44100000722900	<b>40.46</b> <b>404.60</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	40.46 404.60 FC1-720x720
4.	10 ea. (SAWS #11003) Coupling, cast, size 8", Range A 9.05-9.45 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	73.75 737.50 3501 8"	58.00 580.00 Smith Blair 44100000945900	<b>57.96</b> <b>579.60</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	54.00 540.00 FC1-940x940
5.	5 ea. (SAWS #10987) Coupling, cast, size 10", Range A 11.10-11.60 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	105.85 529.25 3501 10"	73.00 365.00 Smith Blair 44100001160900	<b>72.57</b> <b>362.85</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	97.25 486.25 FC2A-10"
6.	10 ea. (SAWS #10988) Coupling, cast, size 12", Range A 13.20-13.50 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	147.00 1,470.00 3501 12"	89.50 895.00 Smith Blair 44100001350900	<b>89.51</b> <b>895.10</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	96.00 960.00 FC1-1356x1356
7.	10 ea. (SAWS #10989) Coupling, cast, size 12", Range B 13.78-14.38 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	147.00 1,470.00 3501 12"	179.50 1,795.00 Smith Blair 46112751440000	<b>179.50</b> <b>1,795.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	105.33 1,053.30 FC2A-1438x1438
8.	10 ea. (SAWS #10990) Coupling, cast, size 16", Range A 17.40-17.80 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	239.50 2,395.00 3501 16"	208.00 2,080.00 Smith Blair 44100001780900	<b>208.92</b> <b>2,089.20</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	188.63 1,886.30 FC2A-1780x1780
9.	10 ea. (SAWS #10991) Coupling, cast, size 16", Range B 18.46-19.00 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	239.50 2,395.00 3501 16"	143.00 1,430.00 Smith Blair 44119201890900	<b>143.56</b> <b>1,435.60</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	199.12 1,991.20 FC2A-1897x1897
10.	10 ea. (SAWS #10993) Coupling, cast, size 20", Range A 21.35-21.75 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	277.90 2,779.00 3501 20"	252.00 2,520.00 Smith Blair 41100216007003	<b>251.17</b> <b>2,511.70</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	333.87 3,338.70 FC2A-2206-2206
11.	10 ea. (SAWS #10994) Coupling, cast, size 20", Range B 21.75-22.25 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	277.90 2,779.00 3501 20"	252.00 2,520.00 Smith Blair 41100220607003	<b>251.17</b> <b>2,511.70</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	333.87 3,338.70 FC2A-2206x2206
12.	5 ea. (SAWS #10995) Coupling, cast, size 24", Range A 25.00-25.80 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	453.90 2,269.50 3501 24"	390.00 1,950.00 Smith Blair 41325802510603	<b>388.62</b> <b>1,943.10</b> <b>Smith Blair 413</b>	567.82 2,839.10 FC2A-2632x2632

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

13.	5 ea. (SAWS #10996) Coupling, cast, size 24", Range B 26.10-26.32 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	453.90 2,269.50 3501 24"	359.00 1,795.00 Smith Blair 41100263208003	<b>359.80</b> <b>1,799.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	567.82 2,839.10 FC2A-2632x2632
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 3</b>	TOTAL	21,669.75	17,975.00	<b>17,948.55</b>	21,637.55
<b>GROUP 4</b>	<b>ACME REPAIR CLAMPS</b>					
1.	100 ea. (SAWS #10365) Clamp, Acme Repair, size 6", length 7-1/2", material stainless steel oneband range 6.84 - 7.24 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	40.65 4,065.00 3121 6"x8"	118.00 11,800.00 Smith Blair 27400000690000	41.65 4,165.00 Smith Blair 226	<b>39.50</b> <b>3,950.00</b> <b>F1-724-7.5</b>
2.	40 ea. (SAWS #10366) Clamp, Acme Repair, size 8", length 7-1/2", material stainless steel one Band coupling, Range 8.99 - 9.39 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	48.50 1,940.00 3121 8"x8"	164.00 6,560.00 Smith Blair 27400000905000	49.83 1,993.20 Smith Blair 226	<b>46.31</b> <b>1,852.40</b> <b>F1-939-7.5</b>
3.	10 ea. (SAWS #10448) Clamp, Acme Repair, size 10", length 7-1/2", material stainless steel one Band coupling, Range 11.34 - 11.74 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	56.45 564.50 3121 10"x8"	206.00 2,060.00 Smith Blair 27400001110000	60.34 603.40 Smith Blair 226	<b>60.62</b> <b>606.20</b> <b>F1-1174-7.5</b>
4.	20 ea. (SAWS #10364) Clamp, Acme Repair, size 12", length 7-1/2", material stainless steel range 13.70 - 14.10 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	66.00 1,320.00 3121 12"x8"	221.50 4,430.00 Smith Blair 27400001320000	70.61 1,412.20 Smith Blair 226	<b>66.77</b> <b>1,335.40</b> <b>F1-1410-7.5</b>
5.	10 ea. (SAWS #10363) Clamp, Acme full circle repair, size 16", length 10", Range 17.82 - 18.57, material stainless steel one Band, used for large diameter pipe coupling Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	218.85 2,188.50 3122 18"x16"	348.00 3,480.00 Smith Blair 27400001740000	155.24 1,552.40 Smith Blair 228	<b>144.59</b> <b>1,445.90</b> <b>F2-1857-10</b>
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 4</b>	TOTAL	10,078.00	28,330.00	9,726.20	<b>9,189.90</b>
<b>GROUP 5</b>	<b>BELL JOINT LEAK CLAMPS</b>					
1.	55 ea. (SAWS #10375) Clamp, bell joint leak, size 6", material ductile iron epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range 6.90 - 7.10 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>87.25</b> <b>4,798.75</b> 3232 6"	118.00 6,490.00 Smith Blair 27400000690000	97.90 5,384.50 Smith Blair 274	60.83 3,345.65 FBC-710-C900
2.	25 ea. (SAWS #10376) Clamp, bell joint leak, size 8", material ductile iron epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range 9.05 - 9.30 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>95.40</b> <b>2,385.00</b> 3232 8"	164.00 4,100.00 Smith Blair 27400000905000	107.08 2,677.00 Smith Blair 274	84.17 2,104.25 FBC-930-C-900
3.	5 ea. (SAWS #10369) Clamp, bell joint leak, size 10", material ductile iron epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range 11.10 - 11.40 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>120.10</b> <b>600.50</b> 3232 10"	206.00 1,030.00 Smith Blair 27400001110000	134.08 670.40 Smith Blair 274	105.51 527.55 FBC-1140 C-900
4.	10 ea. (SAWS #10370) Clamp, bell joint leak, size 12", material ductile iron epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range 13.20 - 13.50 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>193.90</b> <b>1,939.00</b> 3232 20"	221.50 2,215.00 Smith Blair 27400001320000	216.24 2,162.40 Smith Blair 274	114.46 1,144.60 FBC-1350 C-900

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & DATE: (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY					
5.	5 ea. (SAWS #10371) Clamp, bell joint leak, size 16", material ductile iron epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range 17.40 - 17.80 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>261.50</b> <b>1,307.50</b> 3232 16"	348.00 1,740.00 Smith Blair 27400001740000	291.91 1,459.55 Smith Blair 274	662.17 3,310.85 Romac 418-1780
6.	5 ea. (SAWS #10372) Clamp, bell joint leak, size 20", material ductile iron epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range 21.60 - 22.06 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>364.70</b> <b>1,823.50</b> 3232 20"	560.00 2,800.00 Smith Blair 27400002160000	406.09 2,030.45 Smith Blair 274	890.50 4,452.50 Romac 418-2206
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #10373) Clamp, bell joint leak, size 24" material ductile iron epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range 25.80 - 26.32 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>403.70</b> <b>2,018.50</b> 3232 24"	637.84 3,189.20 Smith Blair 274000025800000	450.65 2,253.25 Smith Blair 274	941.77 4,708.85 Romac 418-2632
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 5</b>	TOTAL	<b>14,872.75</b>	21,564.20	16,637.55	19,594.25
<b>GROUP 6</b>	<b>REDI CLAMPS</b>					
1.	25 ea. (SAWS #10437) Clamp, Redi, size 1/2", length 3", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	4.70 117.50 3151W 1/2x3	4.25 106.25 Smith Blair 24500008403000	<b>3.98</b> <b>99.50</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	3.90 97.50
2.	100 ea. (SAWS #10443) Clamp, Redi, size 3/4", length 3", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	4.75 475.00 3151W 3/4x3	4.35 435.00 Smith Blair 24500010503000	<b>4.06</b> <b>406.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	4.00 400.00
3.	40 ea. (SAWS #10436) Clamp, Redi, size 1", length 3", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	5.00 200.00 3151W 1x3	5.85 234.00 Smith Blair 24500013203000	<b>4.44</b> <b>177.60</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	4.32 172.80
4.	50 ea. (SAWS #10438) Clamp, Redi, size 1-1/2", length 3", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	5.50 275.00 3151W 1 1/2x3	5.25 262.50 Smith Blair 24500019003000	<b>4.90</b> <b>245.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	4.79 239.50
5.	10 ea. (SAWS #10439) Clamp, Redi, size 1-1/4", length 3", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	5.15 51.50 3151W 1 1/4x 3	4.86 48.60 Smith Blair 24500016603000	<b>4.56</b> <b>45.60</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	4.50 45.00
6.	45 ea. (SAWS #10440) Clamp, Redi, size 2", length 6", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	11.00 495.00 3151W 2x6	10.33 464.85 Smith Blair 24500023806000	<b>9.69</b> <b>436.05</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	10.83 487.35
7.	30 ea. (SAWS #10441) Clamp, Redi, size 2-1/2", length 6", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	11.55 346.50 3151W 2 1/2x6	14.27 428.10 Smith Blair 2450002886000	<b>12.86</b> <b>385.80</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	13.16 394.80

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

8.	10 ea. (SAWS #10442) Clamp, Redi, size 3", length 6", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	13.05 130.50 3151W 3x6	1,510.00 15,100.00 Smith Blair 24500035006000	<b>14.10</b> <b>141.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	13.93 139.30
9.	10 ea. (SAWS #10445) Clamp, Redi, size 4, length 6", material stainless steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	14.90 149.00 3151W 4x6	16.09 160.90 Smith Blair 24500045006000	<b>15.03</b> <b>150.30</b> <b>Smith Blair 245</b>	14.84 148.40
<b>TOTAL GROUP 6</b>		TOTAL	2,240.00	17,240.20	<b>2,086.85</b>	2,124.65
<b>GROUP 7</b>						
<b>FLANGE ADAPTER STEEL COUPLING</b>						
1.	5 ea. (SAWS #11035) Coupling, flange adapter, size 3", material steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>82.85</b> <b>414.25</b> <b>3521 3"</b>	83.40 417.00 Smith Blair 91290039603000	77.89 389.45 Smith Blair 912	72.93 364.65 FCA501-400 Romac
2.	20 ea. (SAWS #11037) Coupling, flange Coupling, flange adapter, size 4", OD size 4.5 - 4.80, used for steel pipe Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>82.85</b> <b>1,657.00</b> <b>3521 4"</b>	98.75 1,975.00 Smith Blair 91290048604000	92.45 1,849.00 Smith Blair 912	121.22 2,424.40 FCA-480x4
3.	5 ea. (SAWS #11039) Coupling, flange and adapter, size 6", used for steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>83.60</b> <b>418.00</b> <b>3521 6"</b>	130.12 650.60 Smith Blair 91290069606000	93.84 469.20 Smith Blair 912	152.47 762.35 FCA-690x6
4.	5 ea. (SAWS #11041) Coupling, flange adapter, size 8", material steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>105.00</b> <b>525.00</b> <b>3521 8"</b>	173.09 865.45 Smith Blair 91290080008000	117.86 589.30 Smith Blair 912	203.79 1,018.95 FCA-905x8
5.	5 ea. (SAWS #11027) Coupling, flange adapter, size 10", material steel used for steel pipe Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>158.80</b> <b>794.00</b> <b>3521 10"</b>	310.15 1,550.75 Smith Blair 91290107510000	117.26 586.30 Smith Blair 912	224.02 1,120.10 FCA-1075x10
6.	3 ea. (SAWS #11029) Coupling, flange adapter, size 12", OD size 12.75, used for steel pipe Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	<b>170.25</b> <b>510.75</b> <b>3521 12"</b>	344.92 1,034.76 Smith Blair 91290127512000	191.01 573.03 Smith Blair 912	270.66 811.98 FCA-1275x12
<b>TOTAL GROUP 7</b>		UNIT PRICE TOTAL	<b>4,319.00</b>	6,493.56	4,456.28	6,502.43
<b>GROUP 8</b>						
<b>FLANGE ADAPTER CAST IRON COUPLING</b>						
1.	20 ea. (SAWS #11034) Coupling, flange adapter, size 3", OD size 3.80-3.96, material cast iron Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	82.85 1,657.00 3521 3"	78.29 1,565.80 Smith Blair 91290039603000	<b>77.89</b> <b>1,557.80</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	72.93 1,458.60 FCA501-400
2.	50 ea. (SAWS #11036) Coupling, flange adapter, size 4", OD size 4.74 - 5.10, used for cast iron pipe Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	82.85 4,142.50 3521 4"	97.74 4,887.00 Smith Blair 91290051004000	<b>93.39</b> <b>4,669.50</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	121.22 6,061.00 FCA-480x4

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

3.	20 ea. (SAWS #11038) Coupling, flange adapter, size 6", OD size 6.90 - 7.20, material cast iron Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	83.60 1,672.00 3521 6"	124.81 2,496.20 Smith Blair 91290072006000	<b>94.80</b> <b>1,896.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	152.47 3,049.40 FCA-690x6
4.	10 ea. (SAWS #11040) Coupling, flange adapter, size 8", material cast iron Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	105.00 1,050.00 3521 8"	171.32 1,713.20 Smith Blair 91290091108000	<b>119.11</b> <b>1,191.10</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	203.79 2,037.90 FCA-905x8
5.	5 ea. (SAWS #11028) Coupling, flange adapter, size 10", OD size 11.10, material cast iron Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	158.80 794.00 3521 10"	310.15 1,550.75 Smith Blair 91290116010000	<b>177.26</b> <b>886.30</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	235.42 1,177.10 FCA-11.46x10
6.	5 ea. (SAWS #11042) Coupling, flange adapter, size 12", OD size 13.20 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	170.25 851.25 3521 12"	344.92 1,724.60 Smith Blair 91290135012000	<b>192.98</b> <b>964.90</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	276.70 1,383.50 FCA-1356x12
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #11032) Coupling, flanged adapter, size 20", used for ductile iron pipe range 21.35 - 21.75 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	538.00 2,690.00 3528 20"	805.05 4,025.25 Smith Blair 91321602000003	<b>601.02</b> <b>3,005.10</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	569.87 2,849.35 FCA-2160x20
8.	5 ea. (SAWS #11033) Coupling, flanged adapter, size 24", used for ductile iron pipe range 25.71 - 25.89 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	772.00 3,860.00 3528 24"	933.88 4,669.40 Smith Blair 91325802400003	<b>862.94</b> <b>4,314.70</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	659.55 3,297.75 FCA-2580x24
9.	4 ea. (SAWS #11044) Coupling, flanged adapter, size 30" used for ductile iron pipe, range 31.91 - 32.09 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	1,070.00 4,280.00 3528 30"	1,134.08 4,536.32 Smith Blair 91332003000003	<b>351.48</b> <b>1,405.92</b> <b>Smith Blair 912</b>	846.71 3,386.84 FCA-3200x30
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 8</b>	TOTAL	20,996.75	27,168.52	<b>19,891.32</b>	24,701.44
<b>GROUP 9</b>	<b>STEEL COUPLING</b>					
1.	10 ea. (SAWS #10935) Coupling, steel, size 3" used for steel pipe Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 286.80	28.68 286.80 Smith Blair 41190035001003	<b>28.67</b> <b>286.70</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	54.32 543.20 FC3-350-7
2.	10 ea. (SAWS #10963) Coupling, steel, size 4", used for steel pipe Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 362.30	36.23 362.30 Smith Blair 41190045001003	<b>36.22</b> <b>362.20</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	63.00 630.00 FC3-450-7
3.	4 ea. (SAWS #10958) Coupling, steel 38, size 6", OD size 6.625 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 229.44	57.36 229.44 Smith Blair 41190066301003	<b>57.36</b> <b>229.44</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	99.62 398.48 FC3-663-7

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

4.	2 ea. (SAWS #10954) Coupling, steel 38, size 10" Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID	86.62 173.24 Smith Blair 41190107501003	<b>86.18</b> <b>172.36</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	172.67 345.34 FC3-1075-7
5.	4 ea. (SAWS #10955) Coupling, steel 38, size 12", OD size 12.75 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID	103.56 414.24 Smith Blair 41190127501003	<b>103.04</b> <b>412.16</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	195.09 780.36 FC3-1275-7
6.	2 ea. (SAWS #10956) Coupling, steel 38, size 20", OD size 20.00 - 21.60 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID	370.29 740.58 Smith Blair 41321602000603	<b>370.28</b> <b>740.56</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	323.12 646.24 FC4-2160-A10R
7.	2 ea. (SAWS #10957) Coupling, steel 38, size 24", OD size 24.00 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID	311.70 623.40 Smith Blair 41100240007003	<b>311.70</b> <b>623.40</b> <b>Smith Blair 411</b>	359.44 718.88 FC4-2580-A10R
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 9</b>	TOTAL	NO BID	2,830.00	<b>2,826.82</b>	4,062.50
<b>GROUP 10</b>	<b>TRANSITION COUPLING</b>					
1.	5 ea. (SAWS #11243) Coupling, transition, size 10", range DI 11.10 - 11.50 x AC 11.60 - 12.12 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	105.85 529.25 3501 10"	121.42 607.10 Smith Blair 44112201160900	<b>120.80</b> <b>604.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	88.29 441.45 FC2A-1140x1212
2.	10 ea. (SAWS #11232) Coupling, transition, size 12", range DI 13.20 - 13.50 AC 13.90 - 14.2 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	147.00 1,470.00 3501 12"	122.59 1,225.90 Smith Blair 44114201350900	<b>122.58</b> <b>1,225.80</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	110.57 1,105.70 FC2A-1350x1438
3.	5 ea. (SAWS #11234) Coupling, transition, size 16", range 17.40 - 17.40 to 17.40 - 17.80 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	239.50 1,197.50 3501 16"	246.90 1,234.50 Smith Blair 44100001780900	<b>208.92</b> <b>1,044.60</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	188.63 943.15 FC2A-1780x1780
4.	5 ea. (SAWS #11235) Coupling, transition, size 16", range 17.40 - 17.80 x 18.46 - 19.00 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	239.50 1,197.50 3501 16"	189.40 947.00 Smith Blair 44118901780900	<b>189.40</b> <b>947.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 441</b>	193.86 969.30 FC2A-1780x1897
5.	3 ea. (SAWS #11237) Coupling, transition, size 20", range 21.60 - 22.06 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	277.90 833.70 3501 20"	269.66 808.98 Smith Blair 41322062160703	<b>268.28</b> <b>804.84</b> <b>Smith Blair 413</b>	333.87 1,001.61 FC2A-2206x2206
6.	3 ea. (SAWS #11229) Coupling, transition, size 20", range 21.50 - 22.17 x 23.35 - 23.92 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	277.90 833.70 3501 20"	418.60 1,255.80 Smith Blair 41323922160603	<b>371.75</b> <b>1,115.25</b> <b>Smith Blair 413</b>	1,697.52 5,092.56 Romac RTC400 2392x2217
7.	3 ea. (SAWS #11239) Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.30 - 25.80 x 26.10 26.32 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	453.90 1,361.70 3501 24"	426.53 1,279.59 Smith Blair 41326322580603	<b>416.47</b> <b>1,249.41</b> <b>Smith Blair 413</b>	378.07 1,134.21 FC5-2580x2632x10

NO BID



**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & DATE: (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

8.	3 ea. (SAWS #11230) Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.75 - 26.42 x 27.95 -28.62 Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	453.90 1,361.70 3501 24"	418.60 1,255.80 Smith Blair 41326322580603	<b>424.37</b> <b>1,273.11</b> <b>Smith Blair 413</b>	2,236.77 6,710.31 RTC400-2862x2642
9.	3 ea. (SAWS #11238) Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.80 x 26.32, material steel Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	453.90 1,361.70 3501 24"	418.60 1,255.80 Smith Blair 41326322580603	<b>416.47</b> <b>1,249.41</b> <b>Smith Blair 413</b>	378.07 1,134.21 FC5-2580x2632x10
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 10</b>	TOTAL	10,146.75	9,870.47	<b>9,513.42</b>	18,532.50
<b>GROUP 11</b>	<b>DRESSER COUPLING</b>					
1.	65 ea. (SAWS #11011) Coupling, 65B Dresser, size 1/2", material galvanized range Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 493.35	7.59 493.35 Smith Blair 52500008400003	<b>6.12</b> <b>397.80</b> <b>Smith Blair 525</b>	9.69 629.85 Romac 702-084
2.	150 ea. (SAWS #10971) Coupling, dresser, size 3/4", end type comp x comp, material galvanized, style 65 long range Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 1,282.50	8.55 1,282.50 Smith Blair 52500010500003	<b>6.12</b> <b>918.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 525</b>	10.37 1,555.50 702-105
3.	100 ea. (SAWS #11010) Coupling, dresser, size 1", end type comp x comp material galvanized, style 65B long range Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 1,153.00	11.53 1,153.00 Smith Blair 52500013200003	<b>9.18</b> <b>918.00</b> <b>Smith Blair 525</b>	11.92 1,192.00 702-132
4.	60 ea. (SAWS #10968) Coupling, 65B Dresser, size 1-1/2", material galvanized range Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 918.00	15.30 918.00 Smith Blair 52500019000003	<b>12.24</b> <b>734.40</b> <b>Smith Blair 525</b>	16.63 997.80 702-190
5.	10 ea. (SAWS #10969) Coupling, 65B dresser, size 1-1/4", material galvanized range Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 136.10	13.61 136.10 Smith Blair 525000166000003	<b>11.17</b> <b>111.70</b> <b>Smith Blair 525</b>	14.67 146.70 702-166
6.	50 ea. (SAWS #10970) coupling, 65B dresser, size 2", material galvanized range Make and Model	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	NO BID 941.00	18.82 941.00 Smith Blair 52500023800003	<b>17.35</b> <b>867.50</b> <b>Smith Blair 525</b>	21.03 1,051.50 702-238
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 11</b>	TOTAL	NO BID	4,923.95	<b>3,947.40</b>	5,573.35
<b>GROUP 12</b>	<b>WIDE RANGE TRANSITION COUPLING</b>					
1.	50 ea. (SAWS #27624) Coupling, wide range transition, size 4", range 4.25 - 5.63 Approved Model - Hymax 2000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	133.00 6,650.00	<b>127.40</b> <b>6,370.00</b>	126.79 6,339.50	127.42 6,371.00
2.	1,500 ea. (SAWS #27625) Coupling, wide range transition, size 6", range 6.42 - 7.68 Approved Model - Hymax 2000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	175.60 263,400.00	<b>167.41</b> <b>251,115.00</b>	169.12 253,680.00	166.50 249,750.00

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & DATE: (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

3.	500 ea. (SAWS #27626) Coupling, wide range transition, size 8", range 8.54 - 9.84 Approved Model - Hymax 2000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	198.85 99,425.00	<b>192.72</b> <b>96,360.00</b>	189.57 94,785.00	190.51 95,255.00
4.	25 ea. (SAWS #27627) Coupling, wide range transition, size 10", range 10.70 - 12.00 Approved Model - Hymax 2000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	255.80 6,395.00	<b>243.86</b> <b>6,096.50</b>	243.86 6,096.50	245.01 6,125.25
5.	200 ea. (SAWS #27628) Coupling wide range transition, size 12", range 13.15 - 14.41 Approved Model - Hymax 2000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	350.45 70,090.00	<b>334.53</b> <b>66,906.00</b>	336.23 67,246.00	336.21 67,242.00
6.	75 ea. (SAWS #27629) Coupling, wide range transition, size 16", range 17.10 - 19.20 Approved Model - Hymax 2000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	809.95 60,746.25	<b>772.11</b> <b>57,908.25</b>	772.10 57,907.50	776.01 58,200.75
7.	50 ea. (SAWS #11231) Coupling wide range transition, size 20", range 21.50 - 23.60 Approved Model - Hymax 2000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	1,006.60 50,330.00	<b>772.11</b> <b>38,605.50</b>	959.57 47,978.50	964.40 48,220.00
8.	25 ea. (SAWS #27631) Coupling wide range transition, size 24", range 24.60 - 26.70 Approved Model - Hymax 2000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	1,071.85 26,796.25	<b>1,021.78</b> <b>25,544.50</b>	1,021.78 25,544.50	1,026.92 25,673.00
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 12</b>	UNIT TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	583,832.50	<b>548,905.75</b>	559,577.50	556,837.00
<b>GROUP 13</b>	<b>WIDE RANGE REPAIR CLAMPS</b>					
1.	120 ea. (SAWS #27632) Clamp, wide range full circle repair, size 4" x 15", range 4.80 - 5.60, material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	174.70 20,964.00	<b>166.00</b> <b>19,920.00</b>	166.55 19,986.00	167.30 20,076.00
2.	2,550 ea. (SAWS #27633) Clamp, wide range full circle repair, size 6" x 15", range 6.84 - 7.64, material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	219.75 560,362.50	<b>208.34</b> <b>531,267.00</b>	210.55 536,902.50	210.48 536,724.00
3.	750 ea. (SAWS #27634) Clamp, wide range full circle repair, size 8" x 15", range 9.00 - 9.80, material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	246.25 184,687.50	<b>234.00</b> <b>175,500.00</b>	235.96 176,970.00	235.92 176,940.00
4.	40 ea. (SAWS #27635) Clamp, wide range full circle repair, size 10" x 15", range 11.34 - 12.15, material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	304.20 12,168.00	<b>290.00</b> <b>11,600.00</b>	290.01 11,600.40	291.43 11,657.20

NO BID

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**

P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range  
 FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings  
 TIME & (October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 21, 2011  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Act Pipe & Supply  
 4719 Dodge St.  
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Ferguson Waterworks  
 4427 Factory Hill Dr.  
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.  
 1805 Borman Circle Drive  
 St. Louis, MO 63141

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 6959 State Hwy 276  
 Royse City, TX 75189

Morrison Supply Co.  
 5340 N Loop 1604 E  
 San Antonio, TX 78247

5.	175 ea. (SAWS #27636) Clamp, wide range full circle repair, size 12" x 15", range 13.60 - 14.40, material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	360.60 63,105.00	<b>341.50</b> <b>59,762.50</b>	343.75 60,156.25	345.46 60,455.50	<b>NO BID</b>
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 13</b>	TOTAL	841,287.00	<b>798,049.50</b>	805,615.15	805,852.70	
<b>GROUP 14</b>	<b>WIDE RANGE TAPPED CLAMP</b>						
1.	750 ea. (SAWS #27637) Clamp, wide range full circle tapped, size 6" x 2" IP, range 6.84 - 7.64, material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	289.20 216,900.00	<b>274.00</b> <b>205,500.00</b>	277.10 207,825.00	277.02 207,765.00	
2.	275 ea. (SAWS #27638) Clamp, wide range full circle tapped, size 8" x 2" IP, Range 9.00 - 9.80, material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	309.70 85,167.50	<b>294.00</b> <b>80,850.00</b>	296.78 81,614.50	296.72 81,598.00	
3.	10 ea. (SAWS #27369) Clamp, wide range full circle tapped, size 10" x 2" IP, range 11.35 - 12.15 material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	377.25 3,772.50	<b>358.00</b> <b>3,580.00</b>	359.63 3,596.30	361.43 3,614.30	
4.	100 ea. (SAWS #27640) Clamp, wide range full circle tapped, size 12 x 2" IP, range 13.60 - 14.40 material stainless steel Approved Model - EZ-Max Plus Series 4000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL MAKE/MODEL	432.57 43,257.00	<b>410.00</b> <b>41,000.00</b>	412.36 41,236.00	414.32 41,432.00	
	<b>TOTAL GROUP 14</b>	TOTAL	349,097.00	<b>330,930.00</b>	334,271.80	334,409.30	
	<b>AWARD TOTALS FOR VENDORS</b>	TOTAL	<b>78,529.50</b>	<b>1,677,885.25</b>	<b>56,214.36</b>	<b>18,863.20</b>	
	<b>EXTENSION 1</b>	TOTAL	<b>78,529.50</b>	<b>1,677,885.25</b>	<b>56,214.36</b>	<b>18,863.20</b>	
	<b>EXTENSION 2</b>	TOTAL	<b>78,529.50</b>	<b>1,677,885.25</b>	<b>56,214.36</b>	<b>18,863.20</b>	
	Terms		2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	0% 30 days	
	Delivery Days						

**\*DENOTES LOW BIDDER:**

INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Act Pipe & Supply  
 Cascade Water Works  
 Ferguson Waterworks  
 HD Supply Waterworks  
 Morrison Supply Co.  
 Mueller Co.

Municipal Water Works Supply  
 PMI Steel Pipe  
 Powerseal Pipeline Products  
 Romac Industries  
 William Supply Co.

Demandstar  
 SAWS Website